
From: Schulte, Kim
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Subject: RE: CON 6193 HT
Date: Friday, April 18, 2025 9:00:23 AM
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Mackinzey,
Thank you for the opportunity to provide additional information.
 

A Representative Registration form has been attached for Justin Morley.
 

Please replace the Proposed Project Budget that was submitted in original application
with the attached. 

The Major Medical Equipment submitted on initial application =  $1,658,482.  This total
cost included the cost of the MRI unit ($1,595,784) and the cost of the unit back up system
($62,698).
 

The new Proposed Project Budget form that is attached, separates these costs into
two different line items. 

Line Item 5 – Other Equipment (not in construction contract) = $62,698.  This amount
matches the System Backup Unit on Page 22 of the Siemens Quote.

Line Item 6 - Major Medical Equipment Unit cost = $1,595,784.  This amount matches the
system total cost on Page 19 of the Siemens Quote.

Line Item 10 – Other Costs has been deleted.
 

The third attachment is the Siemens quote options that were included in the original
application.  These pages have not changed aside from the notation of acceptance for the
Eaton Back up system.

 
Please let me know if you need additional information or further clarification.  Again, thank you for
the opportunity to provide this information.
 
 
 
Kim Schulte  |  Executive Assistant
SSM Health St. Mary's Hospital - Jefferson City
2505 Mission Drive
Jefferson City, MO  65109
Phone 573-681-3124
Fax 573-681-3621
kim.schulte@ssmhealth.com
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From: Fick, Mackinzey <Mackinzey.Fick@health.mo.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 15, 2025 3:21 PM
To: Morley, Justin <Justin.Morley@ssmhealth.com>
Cc: Schulte, Kim <Kim.Schulte@ssmhealth.com>
Subject: CON 6193 HT
Importance: High

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the SSM Health organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Think this message could be malicious? Click the Report button or forward it
to Phishing@ssmhealth.com

 
Justin,
 
After review of the application, some additional information is needed.

Provide a registered representative form for Justin Morley.

Provide 3rd party documentation or methods/assumptions for the other costs.
I am unable to verify the cost of the unit within the quote. Please advise.

 

This information is needed by Thursday, April 24th, 2025.
 
 

Mackinzey Fick
 

Assistant Program Coordinator
Certificate of Need Agency :
http://health.mo.gov/information/boards/certificateofneed/index.php
Missouri Department of Health and Senior Services
  920 Wildwood Drive, Jefferson City, MO. 65102

*: mackinzey.fick@health.mo.gov | (: 573-751-6403
 

This email is from the Missouri Department of Health and Senior Services.  It contains confidential or
privileged information that may be protected from disclosure by law.  Unauthorized disclosure, review,
copying, distribution, or use of this message or its contents by anyone other than the intended recipient is
prohibited.  If you are not the intended recipient, please immediately destroy this message and notify the
sender at the following email address: mackinzey.fick@health.mo.gov or by calling (573) 751-6403. 

 
 

Confidentiality Notice: This email message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.
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From: Schulte, Kim
To: Fick, Mackinzey
Cc: Morley, Justin
Subject: RE: CON 6193
Date: Monday, May 12, 2025 4:04:01 PM
Attachments: image002.png
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Importance: High

Mackinzey,
You are correct, the trade in was deducted from the vender quote.
Attached is a revised Project Budget with the trade in of $240,000 added to Major Medical
Equipment.
 
The difference in total project financing = Additional application fee of $175.  I have
submitted the payment through the payment portal.
 
Thank you!  Appreciate your help.
Kim
 
 
 
Kim Schulte  |  Executive Assistant
SSM Health St. Mary's Hospital - Jefferson City
2505 Mission Drive
Jefferson City, MO  65109
Phone 573-681-3124
Fax 573-681-3621
kim.schulte@ssmhealth.com
 

 
 
 
From: Fick, Mackinzey <Mackinzey.Fick@health.mo.gov> 
Sent: Monday, May 12, 2025 10:16 AM
To: Schulte, Kim <Kim.Schulte@ssmhealth.com>
Cc: Morley, Justin <Justin.Morley@ssmhealth.com>
Subject: CON 6193
Importance: High

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the SSM Health organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Think this message could be malicious? Click the Report button or forward it
to Phishing@ssmhealth.com
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Kim,
 
After final review of the application, it appears some additional information is needed.

It appears the trade in value was deducted from the unit cost. If this is correct, the trade in
needs to be added back into the value and an additional fee of $174 is needed.

 

This information is needed as soon as possible.
 
 

Mackinzey Fick
 

Assistant Program Coordinator
Certificate of Need Agency :
http://health.mo.gov/information/boards/certificateofneed/index.php
Missouri Department of Health and Senior Services
  920 Wildwood Drive, Jefferson City, MO. 65102

*: mackinzey.fick@health.mo.gov | (: 573-751-6403
 

This email is from the Missouri Department of Health and Senior Services.  It contains confidential or
privileged information that may be protected from disclosure by law.  Unauthorized disclosure, review,
copying, distribution, or use of this message or its contents by anyone other than the intended recipient is
prohibited.  If you are not the intended recipient, please immediately destroy this message and notify the
sender at the following email address: mackinzey.fick@health.mo.gov or by calling (573) 751-6403. 

 
 

Confidentiality Notice: This email message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.
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